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Welfare regimes differ in their impact on social inequality in important ways. While

previous research has explored the shape of stratification across nations and citizens’

normative attitudes towards inequality, scant attention has been given to citizens’

perceptions of actual stratification across welfare regimes. Using the 1999 International

Social Survey Programme, we compare perceptions of inequality in Germany, Sweden, and

the United States. More specifically, we ask how the stratification reality in each country is

assessed by its citizens, whether it meets their stratification aspirations, and whether these

perceptions differ systematically both across and within welfare regimes. Our results show

that perceptions vary in a clear and meaningful way across countries as well as between

different social groups within a given welfare regime. For instance, Americans are more

likely to view society as unequal, but only slightly more likely to prefer that extent of

inequality. Conversely, the Swedish clearly view their society as more equal than citizens

in the United States and Germany, yet not nearly as equal as they would like it to be.

Our multivariate results reveal important similarities and differences as well, such as

socio-economic cleavages in the United States, and cleavages between labour market

insiders and outsiders in Germany.

Introduction

Welfare states influence the structure of social inequal-

ity within and across countries (Esping-Andersen,

1990; Korpi and Palme, 1998; Kenworthy, 1999;

DiPrete, 2002; Palme, 2006; Scruggs and Allan, 2008).

Consequently, research has pointed out how the

welfare state impacts stratification in terms of oppor-

tunities and outcomes (e.g. Esping-Andersen, 1990,

2004, 2005; Korpi and Palme, 1998; Goodin et al.,

1999; Beller and Hout, 2006; Olafsdottir, 2007).

Furthermore, research on attitudes towards inequality

and the welfare state has been intensively occupied

with opinions toward specific policies or broad nor-

mative ideals, such as equity or redistribution (e.g.

Kluegel and Smith, 1986; Kelley and Evans, 1993;

Svallfors, 1993, 1997, 2003; Roller, 1995; Gijsberts,

2002; Linos and West, 2003; Noll and Roberts, 2003;

Kikuzawa, Olafsdottir and Pescosolido, 2008). Yet, less

is known about how the public perceives inequality

and what kind of inequality they are willing to tolerate.

In this article, we evaluate how citizens assess the

structure of social inequality and what shape of

stratification they would prefer. Given the systematic

differences in how welfare states impact stratification

(Esping-Andersen, 1990; Scruggs and Allan, 2008), we
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look at aggregate differences as well as social cleavages
within countries.

Public attitudes not only provide a window into
citizens’ expectations about inequality but have also
been singled out as an important driving force shaping
social policy (Pierson, 1994; Stimson, MacKuen and
Erikson, 1995; Brooks and Manza, 2006; Steensland,
2006). Consequently, an examination of citizens’
assessments and aspirations about social stratification
sheds light on an important aspect of the cultural
foundations of the welfare state (Steensland, 2006; van
Oorschot, 2007).

Using data from the 1999 International Social
Survey Programme (ISSP), we look at citizens’ per-
ceptions and aspirations of social inequality in the
United States, Germany, and Sweden. Stratification
differs sharply across these nations, largely due to the
different role of the state, the market, and the family
within the policy sphere (Esping-Andersen, 1990).
The specific configurations of how these institutions
interact with one another are typically called ‘welfare
regimes’. To better understand why perceptions of
stratification realities and preferences for ideal strati-
fication may vary across nations, we draw upon the
welfare regime literature to frame the context of
respondents’ perceptions in each nation. As we will
discuss further, each of our nations represents the
‘ideal type’ of three different welfare regimes: the
United States, Germany, and Sweden are crucial cases
of liberal, conservative, and social-democratic welfare
regimes, respectively (Esping-Andersen, 1990).

We focus on a small sample of nations rather than a
large-N sample to provide a more nuanced description
of the institutional arrangements in each country
(Ebbinghaus, 2005; Kittel, 2006). This approach
allows for more detailed comparisons of the links
between individual characteristics and perceptions of
stratification in each country. We refer to perceptions
of the stratification order as ‘perceived stratification
realities’, and to people’s respective preferences as
‘stratification aspirations’.

Our article proceeds in four steps. First, we develop
contrasting hypotheses about how and why these
perceptions may differ between individuals. Second,
we describe the institutional contexts of the three
regimes and appropriate our general hypotheses to the
specific countries. Third, we present the results of our
empirical analysis, showing both aggregate differences
in perceptions and preferences across countries as well
as social cleavages within each country. We conclude
by discussing how our results relate to prior research
and recent theoretical developments in the welfare state
literature.

Stratification Realities and
Stratification Aspirations

Achieving greater socio-economic equality has long

been an important goal of modern welfare states

(Marshall, 1950; Wilensky, 1975; Flora, Alber and

Kohl, 1977), and the redistribution of income from

rich to poor has been one of the most important

strategies in realizing this goal (Korpi and Palme, 1998;

Bradley et al., 2003; Alesina and Glaeser, 2004).

Although current pressures for reform may result in

less emphasis on policies aimed towards greater

equality, Kenworthy and Pontusson (2005) have

shown that many welfare states have recently intensi-

fied redistribution in response to increased market

inequality. Hence, reducing inequality still appears to

be important in contemporary welfare states.
Therefore, and because relatively scant research has

focused on attitudes toward inequality per se, we build

on micro-theoretical assumptions originally introduced

in studies of preferences for redistribution in order to

investigate citizens’ perceived stratification realities and

stratification aspirations. Within this framework, atti-

tudes towards inequality and governmental redistribu-

tion are primarily viewed as being based on people’s

material self-interest.1 The basic argument is that

people will be in favour of greater equality and welfare

state intervention if they can hope to gain from it

(Meltzer and Richard, 1981; Pescosolido, Boyer and

Tsui, 1985). Since there tends to be inequality in all

Western democracies, albeit at different levels, a large

proportion of the population can—at least in theory—

hope to gain from redistributive policies aiming to

increase equality. Consequently, in societies with

higher levels of inequality, a higher proportion of

people would potentially stand to profit from de-

manding greater equality and redistribution (cf. also

Romer, 1975; Rehm, 2007).
Although this argument seems intuitively compel-

ling, empirical investigations have found relatively

weak support (Kenworthy and McCall, 2008). One

reason may be that people base their perceptions of

inequality not on the level of market inequality, as

suggested by Meltzer and Richard (1981), but on the

shape of stratification after welfare state intervention

(Kenworthy and McCall, 2008: 60f.). According to

Pierson’s (1994) argument about ‘policy feedback’,

existing institutions and social policies influence actors’

endowments with material resources—and hence their

self-interest.2 Therefore, if the welfare state effectively

counteracts market-generated inequalities, people prof-

iting from these strategies might be satisfied with their
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position in society and therefore not demand greater
equality. Self-interest is thus not inherent to individ-
uals but shaped by institutional contexts.

In line with this argumentation, we assume that
individuals’ self-interest is based on whether they are
positively affected by welfare state-induced changes in
the social structure of their societies or not. We do
not, however, confine this to the receipt of material
cash benefits. For example, studies on government
involvement in health care point to the importance of
social services by showing that those in more vulner-
able positions (e.g. the elderly, women, those with low
levels of education and/or income) are more support-
ive of the role of the government in providing health
care as well as increased spending on health
(Pescosolido, Boyer and Tsui, 1985; Hayes and
VandenHeuvel, 1996; Kikuzawa, Olafsdottir and
Pescosolido, 2008). Furthermore, welfare regimes also
influence labour market structures, employment pat-
terns, and gender roles (Geist, 2003; Fuwa, 2004).
People may thus also consider the wider implications
of the welfare state in determining whether they are
positively or negatively affected by it. Recent research
shows that groups typically found to be less dependent
on the welfare state—e.g. men, people with higher
incomes, or the self-employed—are positive about the
social consequences of the welfare state (such as
increased overall happiness, just distribution of
wealth, more equal opportunities) (van Oorschot,
2010, p. 27). By contrast, having experienced
means-testing tends to be associated with lower levels
of political trust and less support for redistribution
(Kumlin, 2004, p. 215). In our view, it is therefore
important to consider the institutional configuration of
a given welfare regime and how citizens experience its
personal and societal impact at large in trying to
determine which groups are positively affected by a
specific welfare regime and how this affects their
perceptions of and preferences for stratification.
Specifically, we propose a set of contrasting hypotheses
for each aspect:

1a) Those favoured by a specific welfare regime will

be more likely to assess the stratification order of

their society as egalitarian (satisfaction hypothesis:

perception).

1b) Those not benefiting from a specific welfare regime

should be less likely to assess the stratification

order in their societies as egalitarian (disappoint-

ment hypothesis: perception).

2a) Those favoured by a specific welfare regime will be

less likely to prefer a more equal society (satisfac-

tion hypothesis: aspiration).

2b) Those not benefiting from a specific welfare regime

should be more likely aspire to a more equal society

(disappointment hypothesis: aspiration).

These general hypotheses will guide the empirical

investigation of group differences in perceived strati-

fication realities and stratification aspirations. Which

specific groups do and do not benefit from welfare

state intervention varies across regimes. As we extend

previous research by focusing on perceptions of and

preferences for equality, group cleavages in our case

may also differ from those in prior studies that focus

on attitudes towards redistribution and/or specific

policies. As argued above, people’s understanding of

their self-interest and their preferences for inequality

are likely to be embedded within existing institutional

arrangements and their perceptions thereof. In the

following section we describe the respective stratifica-

tion realities in the United States, Germany, and

Sweden and appropriate our hypotheses to each

context.

The Welfare State as a Creator
of Stratification

Esping-Andersen’s (1990) three worlds of welfare

capitalism is the most widely used categorization of

welfare states. He distinguishes between liberal,

conservative and social-democratic welfare states.3

Importantly, in this work, the welfare state is

characterized not only as ‘a mechanism that intervenes

in, and possibly corrects, the structure of inequality;

it is, in its own right, a system of stratification’

(Esping-Andersen, 1990, p. 23). Yet, welfare regimes

influence the shape of stratification differently across

nations. For example, one type may cultivate status

differences while another one may create dualisms

between various groups and yet another one promotes

universal social rights. These distinctions parallel the

differentiation between liberal, conservative, and

social-democratic welfare regimes.
It has been rightly pointed out that regimes repre-

sent ideal-types whose real-life incorporations might

deviate from the ideal-typical world they describe

(Jaeger, 2006). Yet, it is possible to identify genuine

stratification effects for each regime (Esping-Andersen,

1990; Scruggs and Allan, 2008). We now describe the

different institutional contexts as well as the empirical

realities that characterize the shape of stratification in

the United States, Germany, and Sweden in order to

derive more specific hypothesis about group differ-

ences in assessments of the stratification order.

STRATIFICATION REALITIES AND ASPIRATIONS 151
 at M

PI Study of Societies on June 12, 2013
http://esr.oxfordjournals.org/

D
ow

nloaded from
 

http://esr.oxfordjournals.org/


Stratification in the Liberal Welfare State

In general, liberal welfare states like the United States

make little efforts to mitigate market-generated in-

equalities (Korpi and Palme, 1998; Goodin et al., 1999).

While (pre-government) market-based income inequal-

ity tends to be similar across different welfare regimes,
post-government inequality is significantly lower in

social-democratic and conservative regimes than in

liberal ones (Goodin et al., 1999, p. 176). Poverty rates

are also higher, poverty is more severe, and poverty spells

last longer in liberal as compared to other welfare

regimes (Goodin et al., 1999, p. 154ff.; Kenworthy, 1999;

Brady, 2003; Fouarge and Layte, 2005).
Yet, liberal welfare states do not leave their citizens

completely unprotected from market forces. Among

the most important measures of social protection are

means-tested poor relief or income maintenance
programmes. These policies are largely aimed at the

genuinely poor, often emphasizing self-help and

individual responsibility, and service use is associated

with stigma (Titmuss, 1968; Sachweh, Ullrich and

Christoph, 2007). For most citizens, however, services

are provided through the market, either directly or

through private or social insurance. Thus, the liberal
welfare regime divides citizens into three groups, with

one group at the bottom relying on stigmatizing poor

relief, another in the middle as clients of social

insurance, and a final group at the top sufficiently

privileged to derive its welfare from the market

(Esping-Andersen, 1990, p. 65). The United States is

frequently viewed as the ideal type of the liberal welfare

regime and likely the country where the mechanisms
play out most clearly. This can be seen in the highest

amount of private health care spending on the one

hand side and high levels of means-tested poor-relief

on the other hand side (Scruggs and Allan, 2008).
However, while inequality of outcomes tends to be

high in liberal welfare states, they harbour a myth of

equal opportunities. This seems to be particularly the

case in the United States, where a majority of the

population overestimates its prospects for social and

economic mobility (DiPrete, 2007). Although it is

certainly true that the proportion of the population
participating in post-secondary education is higher in

the United States than in many European countries,

access to tertiary education is also more unequal

(Goodin et al., 1999, p. 179). Since access to higher

education is of crucial importance for weakening the

link between social origin and occupational destination

in liberal welfare states (Beller and Hout, 2006, p. 362),
inequality of outcomes does not seem to be off-set by

greater mobility.

In this context, socio-economic cleavages are

assumed to be at the core of how citizens view society

(Esping-Andersen, 1990, p. 228; Svallfors, 1997,

p. 285). Thus, we would expect that those favoured

by the institutional set-up of the liberal welfare state in

the United States will be those in higher socio-

economic positions who are more likely to have their

welfare needs met via market provision. Consequently,

they should be more likely to assess the United States

as egalitarian (satisfaction hypothesis: perception), while

those not benefiting as much from the liberal welfare

state, i.e. people in lower socio-economic positions,

should be less likely to do so (disappointment hypoth-

esis: perception). Conversely, those benefiting from the

liberal welfare arrangement should be less likely to

prefer a more egalitarian society (satisfaction hypothesis:

aspiration) while those not benefiting from it should be

more likely aspire to a more equal society (disappoint-

ment hypothesis: aspiration).

Stratification in the Conservative

Welfare State

Stratification in conservative welfare states is usually

less pronounced than in liberal ones, yet they also

maintain (and often reinforce) market-generated

inequalities and occupational status distinctions

(Esping-Andersen, 1990). Conservative welfare states

are more encompassing than liberal welfare states in

terms of the risks they cover and often operate on the

basis of social insurance systems whose benefits are

closely tied to the labour-market earnings of individ-

uals (Esping-Andersen, 1990, p. 27). The emphasis is

on the preservation of status and the provision of

security and stability over the life-course; redistribution

across classes is fairly low. Policies are paternalistic,

as reflected for instance in the privileges enjoyed by

civil servants in countries like France or Germany

(Esping-Andersen, 1990, p. 59).
The German welfare state is often cited as the

archetype of a conservative welfare regime (Offe, 1998;

Leitner and Lessenich, 2003). Albeit Germany faced

a decline in the occupational fragmentation of the

welfare system in recent years—e.g. in terms of

pension expenditures devoted to public employees (as

a percentage of GDP) and in the number of occupa-

tionally distinct pension schemes (Scruggs and Allan,

2008)—the conservative elements of the German

welfare state are still more pronounced than in the

United States or Sweden. For instance, status preser-

vation among the elderly is greater in corporatist than

in liberal welfare regimes (Palme, 2006, p. 399).
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Furthermore, adding to the conservative nature of

the German welfare state, comparative stratification

research has repeatedly shown that social mobility is

particularly low compared to other European nations

(e.g. Erikson and Goldthorpe, 1992; Müller and Pollak,

2004). The conservative welfare regime can be thought

to influence this situation since equality of opportunity

seems to be related to the way family policies are set

up. As German family policy continues to be centred

around the ‘male-breadwinner’ model, it may contrib-

ute to unequal opportunities (Sørensen, 2006).

Especially the limited number of public child care

facilities seems to discourage greater female labour

force participation in Germany, which could reduce

income disparities among households and thus foster

more equal opportunities for children. Given that

income redistribution in conservative regimes is mostly

of a horizontal nature (i.e. redistribution across the

life-cycle), the German welfare state can be character-

ized by moderate equality of outcome and low equality

of opportunity.
Within the German conservative welfare regime,

benefits are closely linked to labour market position

and cleavages are likely between ‘insiders’ with a good

position and adequate social insurance, and ‘outsiders’

(e.g. those in part-time or precarious employment and

the unemployed) (Esping-Andersen, 1990, p. 227;

Svallfors, 1997, p. 285). Therefore, we expect that the

insiders of the labour market will be more likely to

view society as equal (satisfaction hypothesis: percep-

tion), while the outsiders will be more likely to view

Germany as unequal (disappointment hypothesis: per-

ception). In contrast, labour market insiders should be

less likely to aspire to a more equal society (satisfaction

hypothesis: aspiration), while labour market outsiders

should be more likely to do so (disappointment

hypothesis: aspiration).

Stratification in the Social-democratic

Welfare State

The social-democratic welfare regime represents the

model with the strongest equalizing effects of the three

regime types distinguished by Esping-Andersen (1990).

Through its focus on universal programmes and the

provision of individual autonomy (not only from the

market but also from the family), the social democratic

welfare regime achieves a considerable redistributive

and decommodifying effect. Universal social pro-

grammes encompass large parts of the population

and grant equal benefits to all, regardless of income

or status.

It is not surprising that the social-democratic welfare
regime usually performs best in comparative assess-
ments of social policy outcomes (Korpi and Palme,
1998; Goodin et al., 1999). Scruggs and Allan (2008)
for instance find the greatest coverage rates and
lowest benefit inequality regarding social programmes
in social democratic countries such as Sweden,
Norway, Finland, and Denmark—especially when
compared to the United States and Germany.
Moreover, Goodin et al. (1999, p. 186) concluded
that social-democratic welfare regimes achieve greater
success in reducing income inequality in the short and
especially in the long run. Furthermore, comparative
analyses of poverty dynamics reveal that poverty rates
are lower, poverty is less severe, and poverty spells are
of shorter duration in social democratic welfare states
(Goodin et al., 1999; DiPrete, 2002; Brady, 2003;
Fouarge and Layte, 2005).

The Scandinavian countries also achieve a remark-
able degree of equality of opportunity (Erikson and
Jonsson, 1996) and exhibit low levels of child poverty
(Esping-Andersen, 2005; Palme, 2006), which some
observers attribute to the ‘dual-earner’ family policies
pursued in these welfare regimes (e.g. Esping-
Andersen, 2005; Sørensen, 2006). These policies are
characterized by parental leaves, a strong encourage-
ment of female labour force participation, and the
availability of public child care from early childhood
on. Thus, the social-democratic welfare regime com-
bines relatively high equality of outcomes with high
levels of equality of opportunity.

The Swedish welfare state is often characterized as
the prototype of the social-democratic welfare regime.
It is universalistic in nature and generous in terms of
benefit levels. This is possible because the majority
of the working age population is active in the labour
force. Sweden has a large public sector with a predom-
inantly female employee body, likely resulting in
cleavages based on gender and sector (Esping-
Andersen, 1990, p. 227; Svallfors, 1997, p. 285).
Therefore, we expect that those favoured by the
welfare state will be women and/or employees of the
public sector who should be more likely to view
Sweden as equal (satisfaction hypothesis: perception).
Those not benefiting as much from welfare state
intervention—i.e. men and/or employees in the private
sector—should be less likely to assess their society as
egalitarian (disappointment hypothesis: perception).
Conversely, women and/or employees in the public
sector should be less likely to prefer a more egalitarian
society (satisfaction hypothesis: aspiration), while men
and/or private sector workers should be more likely to
do so (disappointment hypothesis: aspiration).

STRATIFICATION REALITIES AND ASPIRATIONS 153
 at M

PI Study of Societies on June 12, 2013
http://esr.oxfordjournals.org/

D
ow

nloaded from
 

http://esr.oxfordjournals.org/


Hypotheses for all three countries are summarized
in Table 1.

Data and Methods

In order to test these hypotheses, we use data from the
1999 ISSP module on ‘social inequality’ for the United
States, Germany, and Sweden. Our dependent variables
are (i) perceptions of a country’s stratification order—
‘perceived stratification reality’, and (ii) preferences for
a stratification order—‘stratification aspirations’.
Respondents were shown a card with five different
shapes of society, depicting (i) a society with a small
elite at the top, very few people in the middle and the
great mass of people at the bottom (small elite), (ii) a
pyramid with a small elite at the top, more people in
the middle, and most at the bottom (pyramid), (iii) a
pyramid except that just a few people are at the very
bottom (christmas tree), (iv) most people located
in the middle (middle), and (v) many people near
the top, and only a few near the bottom (rich).
Respondents were asked to indicate (i) what they
thought their society actually looked like and (ii) what
it should look like (see Figure A1). Although the
formulation of the question itself does not indicate an
ordering of the categories along an ‘inequality/
equality’-dimension, there is a clear underlying order-
ing to at least some of the inequality shapes. All five
pictograms represent different shapes of unequal
societies, but the proportions of the population
holding lower, middle, or upper social positions vary.
We assume that the diagrams with few people in lower
social positions are perceived to be more equal than
the ones with many people in low social positions.
For instance, it is clear that the small elite diagram
(Type 1) represents higher levels of inequality (with

most people at the bottom of society) than the middle

diagram (Type 4, with most people in the middle).

However, as the ordering of some adjacent categories is

not entirely unambiguous (for instance, is Type 4, with

most in the middle, more unequal than Type 5, with

most near the top and very few at the bottom?), it is

inappropriate to use statistical models that require an

ordered dependent variable, but in our discussion we

view some types as more unequal than others.
Our main independent variables are two indicators

for respondents’ socio-economic position (education

and income),4 employment status, gender, and the

employment sector. Furthermore, we control for age,

region (East Germany), and people’s support for

redistribution, but do not formulate specific hypoth-

eses for these variables. Following other comparative

work, income is recoded into a set of binary variables,

with relative affluence representing the upper 20 per

cent, relative poverty representing the lower

20 per cent, and the remaining 60 per cent of the

income distribution representing the income middle

and serving as the reference group in the multivariate

analyses (Olafsdottir, 2007; Bolzendahl and Olafsdottir,

2008). Education is a binary variable indicating

whether a respondent has tertiary education or not.

Employment status differentiates between five cate-

gories: full-time employment, part-time employment,

unemployed, retired, and not in labour force (e.g.

students, housewives, etc.). Respondents’ sex is a

dichotomous variable (1¼ female; 0¼male) as is the

variable for employment sector indicating whether a

respondent is employed in the public (1) or private

sector (0). For Sweden, we include an interaction

term for women working in the public sector.

We control for age (in years), individuals’ support

for redistribution5 (on a 5-point scale, with higher

Table 1 Summary of hypothesized effects by country

Perceived stratification reality Stratification aspirations

Benefiting from welfare regime
(satisfaction hypothesis)

More likely to perceive stratification
reality as egalitarian

Less likely to prefer more egali-
tarian stratification order

United States Higher socio-economic positions
Germany Labour market insiders (full-time)
Sweden Women, public sector employees

Disadvantaged by welfare regime
(disappointment hypothesis)

Less likely to perceive stratification
reality as egalitarian

More likely to prefer more egali-
tarian stratification order

United States Low socio-economic positions
Germany Labour market outsiders (part-time, unemployed)
Sweden Men, private-sector employees
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numbers indicating stronger support), and in Germany

for region (1¼ East Germany). As prior research has

shown, younger people tend to be less accepting of

inequality due to their (alleged) post-materialist value

orientations (e.g. Kelley and Evans, 1993; Svallfors,

1993, p. 276f.), as are people holding egalitarian justice

beliefs (Lewin-Epstein, Kaplan and Levanon, 2003;

Sachweh, Ullrich and Christoph, 2007) and East

Germans given their socialization in a former socialist

country (Roller, 1997). A full table including descrip-

tive statistics is included in the appendix (Table A1).

Given the observed differences between East and West

Germany, we provide the descriptive statistics separ-

ately for Germany. However, the small sample size of

each sample, if separated, does not allow us to

distinguish between West and East Germany in our

regression models.
Although it can be argued that our dependent

variables have some underlying ordering, both repre-

sent nominal categorical outcomes. Therefore, multi-

nomial logit regression models are most appropriate

(Long, 1997; Long and Freese, 2001). For testing the

hypotheses derived in the previous section, we estimate

two multinomial logit models for each country (one

per dependent variable).6 In order to ease interpret-

ation of our results, we only present results for those

independent variables for which we hypothesize sig-

nificant effects. Full tables can be found in the

appendix (Tables A2–A4).

Stratification Realities and
Aspirations across Countries

Before investigating the hypothesized regime-specific

cleavages, we illustrate the aggregate differences in

perceived stratification realities and stratification as-
pirations in the three countries. Figures 1 and 2 display

which percentage of the population in each country

perceives a particular stratification reality and, respect-

ively, which percentage of the population aspires to a

particular stratification order.
Figure 1 shows that US citizens perceive their country

to be highly unequal. A sizeable portion (17.5 per cent)

characterizes their society as having few people on
top and the majority at the bottom, and over half

of the US respondents (52 per cent) view the US

stratification order as having a pyramid-like shape

(pyramid, christmas tree), with the higher proportion

of those respondents (32.7 per cent) perceiving the
more unequal shape. Roughly a third of the US

citizens (30.6 per cent) view their society as being

dominated by the middle class.
The perception of the German stratification reality

differs between the Eastern and Western part of the

country. As expected, West Germans perceive the

stratification order to be somewhat less unequal than

East Germans. While about 12 per cent of West
Germans believe that their society is characterized by a

small elite and most people in the bottom, almost

32.7

30.2

30.2

25.6

19.3
28.3

25.9

29.1

28.1 27.3
21.3
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0%

10%
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40%
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80%
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US West-Germany East-Germany Sweden

5) Rich: Most people at the top, few near the bottom

4) Middle: Most people in the middle

3) Christmas Tree: Pyramid, few at the bottom

2) Pyramid: Pyramid, small elite, more in the middle, most at
the bottom

1) Small Elite: Small elite on top, few in the middle, most at
the bottom

Figure 1 Perceived stratification realities in the United States, Germany, and Sweden.

Source: ISSP 1999; N¼ 1.075 (United States), 766 (West Germany), 441 (East Germany), 1.031 (Sweden)
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20 per cent of the East Germans hold this view. Almost

59 per cent of the West Germans believe that the

German society has a pyramid-like shape (pyramid,

christmas tree), while 56 per cent of the East Germans

believe the same. A third of the respondents in West

Germany views society dominated by the middle class,

while 24.3 per cent in East Germany hold this view.

Germans’ perception of their stratification reality thus

is split: East Germans are similar to Americans in

how they evaluate the stratification order of Germany,

while West Germans seem to resemble Swedes to some

extent.
In Sweden, the proportion viewing Swedish society

as highly unequal is smaller, though by no means

negligible (11.2 per cent). As in the United States, over

half of the Swedish respondents view their society as

being shaped like a pyramid (54.7 per cent), with the

more egalitarian view (christmas tree) being endorsed

to a greater extent (29.1 per cent), and a minority of

roughly 26 per cent believes that most people are at the

bottom. Over a third of the Swedish respondents

regard Sweden as a country dominated by a large

middle class (34.2 per cent).
Figure 2 shows how these assessments correspond

with the stratification order citizens prefer. There is a

clear discrepancy between the shape of society citizens

think to be true and the one they would want to be

true in all three countries. More than two-thirds of the

citizens in the United States (72.9 per cent) would

prefer their society to be dominated by a sizeable

middle class, and only a minority (27.1 per cent) opts

for a pyramid-like shape of the United States. In

Germany, egalitarian preferences are slightly greater

among respondents from the Western part, of which

76.4 per cent would like Germany to consist mostly of

the middle class (compared to 73.5 per cent in East

Germany). Only about a fifth of the respondents in

East and West would prefer one of the other shapes of

the German stratification order. Finally, the Swedish

respondents stand out as remarkably egalitarian. Over

80 per cent of the Swedes would prefer to live in

a society that has most people in the middle class,

and again only a minority (17.2 per cent) of the

respondents would want their society to be shaped like

a pyramid.
These aggregate differences can be meaningfully

interpreted across welfare regimes: Americans view

their society as highly unequal, followed by East

Germans, while Swedes view their country as most

equal. However, Sweden is not as equal as they would

prefer. West Germans are in between: while they

resemble Swedes in their assessment of the German

stratification reality, they do display smaller egalitarian

aspirations. East Germans again resemble Americans

and appear to be somewhat more comfortable with

inequality.7 These findings correspond to previous
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Figure 2 Stratification aspirations in the United States, Germany, and Sweden.

Source: ISSP 1999; N¼ 1.075 (United States), 766 (West Germany), 441 (East Germany), 1.031 (Sweden)
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findings showing clear-cut regime differences in atti-

tudes towards inequality on the aggregate level

(Svallfors, 1997, 2003; Linos and West, 2003; Jaeger,

2006). However, prior evidence on regime-specific

attitudinal cleavages is more ambiguous. While some
researchers report evidence supporting the idea that

welfare regimes create systematic attitudinal differences

between social groups (Andreß and Heien, 2001; Linos

and West, 2003; Jaeger, 2006) others have not been

able to do so (Svallfors, 1997, 2003). Therefore, we

now investigate whether there are distinct cleavages in
perceived stratification realities and aspirations that

align with our hypotheses. In discussing the results, we

focus only on those variables for which we expect

significant effects in the respective countries.

Cleavages in Stratification
Realities and Aspirations
within Countries

Table 2 presents results from a likelihood-ratio test of
the independent variables for each model. A significant

�2 indicates that a particular variable affects

perceptions across the five categories. This test pro-

vides an estimate of whether the variable has signifi-

cant effects across the contrasts, but does not capture

whether the effect is positive or negative. Therefore,

these results only reflect what matters; how factors

affect perceptions follows in Tables 3–5. The findings

in Table 2 reveal that, as expected, attitudinal cleavages

differ across countries. The general pattern of effects

supports our hypotheses. We find that education (as

an indicator of respondents’ socio-economic position)

significantly affects stratification realities and aspir-

ations in the United States, labour market status

significantly influences stratification realities and as-

pirations in Germany, and gender and public sector

employment of women significantly affect stratification

aspirations in Sweden.
We also obtain several significant effects for variables

for which we do not hypothesize effects, such as

part-time employment and support for redistribution

in the United States, relative affluence, age, sex, region,

and support for redistribution in Germany, and age,

education, unemployment, and support for redistribu-

tion in Sweden. As the direction of these effects does

not run counter to our hypotheses, we focus on the

Table 2 Chi-square tests for overall effects from multinominal logit analysis of the independent variables
on perceived stratification realities and aspirations in the United States, Germany, and Sweden

United States Germany Sweden

Reality Aspiration Reality Aspiration Reality Aspiration
v2 v2 v2 v2 v2 v2

Age 3.28 4.44 4.71 15.52** 32.87*** 30.90***

Female 4.70 4.57 4.78 9.35* 2.89 21.51***

College 21.37*** 16.61*** 3.87 0.21 15.97*** 4.50
Income (Ref.: income middle)

Relative affluence 1.43 3.06 6.25 10.71* 9.92 3.46
Relative poverty 0.68 5.67 5.93 0.36 0.58 1.81

Employment status (Ref.: not in labour force)
Employed fulltime 6.47 2.43 10.18* 16.27** 1.38 3.93
Employed part-time 14.74** 4.97 6.94 10.41* 3.88 2.18
Unemployed 3.47 2.22 9.36* 6.70 3.20 11.68*
Retired 3.14 4.84 2.13 4.44 5.83 6.40

Public sector 3.53 6.99 5.36 2.95 3.41 2.11
East Germany – – 3.22 26.57*** – –
Female� public sector – – – – 0.86 8.03*
Support for redistribution 40.56*** 16.805** 13.40* 4.95 49.61*** 4.20

LR-test 116.27 86.73 93.64 97.66 169.69 108.39
Probability 4LR 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Pseudo R2 0.13 0.10 0.10 0.11 0.19 0.14
N 896 874 925 899 880 835

Source: ISSP 1999, *P50.05, **P50.01, ***P50.001, Pseudo R2 refers to Cragg–Uhler R2.
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interpretation of the hypothesized effects. Full results
are reported in Tables A1–A3.

We now turn to a more detailed discussion of our
hypothesis and look at changes in predicted probabil-
ities (Tables 3–5). The coefficients for the different
categories of the dependent variable in Tables 3–5
display the magnitude of the change in the predicted
probability of an outcome for a given change in the
independent variable (cf. Long, 1997, p. 167). All
results are obtained while controlling for the other
variables we do not address explicitly in our hypoth-
eses (i.e. age, gender, employment status, employment
sector, and support for redistribution in the United
States; age, gender, income, education, employment

sector, region, and support for redistribution in
Germany; and age, education, income, employment
status, and support for redistribution in Sweden). In
the respective models, control variables are being held
at their means.

Cleavage Structures in the

United States

For the United States, we expect socio-economic
cleavages to emerge and therefore consider the effects
of education and income on stratification realities and
aspirations. Looking at the effects of education on
perceived stratification realities (Table 3, Panel 1), we

Table 4 Change in predicted probabilities for perceived stratification realities and stratification aspirations,
Germany

Independent variables Change Categories of dependent variable

(1) Small
elite

(2) Pyramid (3) Christmas
tree

(4) Middle
class

(5) Rich

Panel 1: Realities
Employed fulltime 0! 1 0.00 0.13 �0.09 �0.05 0.00
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.07 0.20 �0.08 �0.05 0.00
Unemployed 0! 1 0.05 0.18 �0.11 �0.13 0.00
Retired 0! 1 �0.03 0.00 �0.01 0.04 0.01

Panel 2: Aspirations
Employed fulltime 0! 1 �0.00 �0.07 0.11 0.06 �0.10
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.01 �0.09 0.03 0.10 �0.03
Unemployed 0! 1 �0.00 �0.05 0.16 �0.02 �0.09
Retired 0! 1 �0.00 �0.05 0.08 �0.02 �0.00

Note: 0! 1 is the discrete change from 0 to 1. Not in labour force is the reference group for employment status. Results are obtained while controlling for

age, gender, income, education, employment sector, region (East Germany), and support for redistribution. Control variables are held at their means.

Table 3 Change in predicted probabilities for perceived stratification realities and stratification aspirations,
United States

Independent
variables

Change Categories of dependent variable

(1) Small
elite

(2) Pyramid (3) Christmas
tree

(4) Middle
class

(5) Rich

Panel 1: Realities
College 0! 1 �0.09 �0.07 0.08 0.09 �0.01
Relative affluence 0! 1 �0.03 �0.00 �0.00 0.03 �0.00
Relative poverty 0! 1 0.00 0.01 �0.00 �0.01 �0.00

Panel 2: Aspirations
College 0! 1 �0.02 �0.04 �0.05 0.06 0.04
Relative affluence 0! 1 0.00 0.03 0.03 �0.05 �0.01
Relative poverty 0! 1 �0.00 �0.00 0.06 �0.05 �0.02

Note: 0! 1 is the discrete change from 0 to 1. Income Middle is the reference group for the income variable. Results are obtained while controlling

for age, gender, employment status, employment sector, and support for redistribution. Control variables are held at their means.
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find that having a college education decreases the

probability of perceiving the United States as unequal

(small elite or pyramid) and it increases the prob-

ability of perceiving the United States as having a

more middle-class based shape of stratification

(Christmas tree or middle class). Americans with a

college education thus neither perceive American

society to be highly unequal nor very egalitarian.

This finding is in line with the satisfaction hypothesis

for perceptions. However, we do not find significant

effects for income (see Table 2). Neither does being

relatively affluent nor being relatively poor significantly

affect how one views the American stratification order.

The absence of an effect for those in disadvantaged

positions rejects the disappointment hypothesis for

perceptions.
Regarding stratification aspirations (Table 3,

Panel 2), we observe that college education decreases

the probability of preferring one of the more unequal

stratification orders (small elite, pyramid), while

it increases the probability of preferring a more

egalitarian stratification order (middle class or rich).

Being relatively affluent does not significantly influence

stratification aspirations. These findings do not support

our satisfaction hypothesis for aspirations but instead

indicate that those positively affected by the liberal

welfare regime would prefer a more equal society. The

absence of a significant effect for relative poverty and

the positive effect for college education indicate that

the disappointment hypothesis for aspirations is not

supported. In sum, socio-economic cleavages with

regard to perceived stratification realities and aspir-

ations are present in the United States, but appear to be

moderate.

Cleavage Structures in Germany

Due to the direct link of welfare to the labour market
in the conservative German welfare state, we expect
attitudinal cleavages to emerge between labour market
insiders and outsiders. The assessments of the German
stratification reality (Table 4, Panel 1) show that being
unemployed increases the probability of an unequal
perception of Germany (small elite, pyramid) and that
it decreases the probability of a middle-class based
assessment of the German stratification order
(Christmas tree, middle class). Hence, the unemployed
view Germany as more unequal. This is in line with
the disappointment hypothesis for perceptions, indi-
cating that those outside the labour market have a
more inegalitarian image of the German stratification
order. Yet, as we do not find a significant effect for
part-time employment, the disappointment hypothesis
for perceptions receives partial support. Moreover, we
also find that those in full-time employment regard the
German stratification order to be relatively unequal.
Being employed full-time increases the probability of
perceiving a rather inegalitarian stratification order
(small elite or pyramid), and it decreases the prob-
ability of a more egalitarian perception of German
society (Christmas tree and middle class). These
findings do not support the satisfaction hypothesis
for perceptions of the German stratification order.

Looking at stratification aspirations (Table 4, Panel
2), we observe significant effects for labour market
insiders as compared to outsiders. Being employed
full-time increases the probability of preferring a
society with a large middle class (middle class) and
one like a pyramid with few at the bottom (Christmas
tree), while it decreases the probability of preferring a

Table 5 Change in predicted probabilities in perceived stratification realities and stratification aspirations,
Sweden

Independent variables Change Categories of dependent variable

(1) Small
elite

(2) Pyramid (3) Christmas
tree

(4) Middle
class

(5) Rich

Panel 1: Realities
Female 0! 1 �0.01 0.02 �0.07 0.06 0.00
Public sector 0! 1 0.03 0.02 �0.04 �0.00 0.00
Female� public sector 0! 1 �0.02 �0.04 0.01 �0.03 �0.00

Panel 2: Aspirations
Female 0! 1 �0.73 0.02 0.02 0.33 0.35
Public sector 0! 1 �0.00 0.01 �0.01 �0.03 0.03
Female� public sector 0! 1 1.00 �0.05 �0.07 �0.49 �0.38

Note: 0! 1 is the discrete change from 0 to 1. Results are obtained while controlling for age, education, income, employment status, and support

for redistribution. Control variables are held at their means.
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society with many at the bottom (small elite), one

shaped like a pyramid (pyramid) and one with most

people at the top (rich). This does not fully support

the satisfaction hypothesis for aspirations but instead
indicates that the full-time employed show egalitarian

aspirations, though these are curtailed to some extent.

For those in part-time employment, we observe

somewhat greater egalitarian aspirations as being

employed part-time increases the probability of pre-
ferring a society with a large middle class and one

shaped like a pyramid with few at the bottom, while it

decreases the probability of preferring a society with

many at the bottom and one shaped like a pyramid.
While this is in line with the disappointment hypoth-

esis for aspirations, being unemployed, however, does

not significantly affect stratification aspirations in

Germany. Thus, the disappointment hypothesis is

partly confirmed for German stratification aspirations.
In sum, we see that labour market outsiders in

Germany (the unemployed) tend to have a rather
inegalitarian image of the German stratification order.

Looking at their stratification aspirations, however, we

see that only those in part-time employment show

significant egalitarian aspirations. Labour market out-

siders in Germany, though disappointed by the
German stratification reality, thus only hold moderate

aspirations towards greater equality. This is partial

support for the disappointment hypothesis, both for

perceptions and aspirations. Moreover, those in

full-time employment tend to hold unfavourable
images of the German stratification order, but also

aspire to a moderately more—but not too—egalitarian

stratification order. Thus, the satisfaction hypothesis is

partially supported for preferences, but not for
perceptions.

Cleavage Structures in Sweden

In Sweden, we do not find any significant effects in

line with either the satisfaction or disappointment
hypotheses for perceived stratification realities (see

Tables 2 and 5, Panel 1).
Looking at stratification aspirations in Sweden

(Table 5, Panel 2), we find a large effect for gender,

with women being more likely than men to prefer the

most egalitarian forms of stratification (middle class,

rich). Conversely, being female decreases the probabil-
ity of preferring the most inegalitarian shape of

stratification (small elite). This is not in line with the

satisfaction hypothesis for aspirations in Sweden.

However, looking at the interaction of gender with
employment in the public sector, the pattern reverses.

Swedish women working in the public sector appear to

have weaker egalitarian aspirations than their

private-sector counterparts, as their probabilities for

aspiring to the most egalitarian forms of society

decrease, while the probability of preferring a society

with a small elite and most people at the bottom

increases. This finding is in line with the satisfaction

hypothesis for aspirations. We do not find support for

the disappointment hypothesis for aspirations in

Sweden.

Summary and Conclusions

In this article, we asked how Americans, Germans, and

Swedes assess the shape of stratification in their

country (perceived stratification realities), whether

this shape is in line with what they would prefer

(stratification aspirations), and whether these percep-

tions differ systematically across welfare regimes and

between social groups within each country. On the

aggregate level, we find clear and interpretable differ-

ences across regimes. While Americans view their

society as highly inegalitarian, their aspirations for a

more egalitarian shape of stratification are smaller than

those of Swedes or West Germans. Thus, perceptions

of high levels of inequality do not automatically seem

to translate into stronger egalitarian demands. This can

also be observed with regard to the attitudes of East

German respondents, which resemble those of

Americans. East Germans and Americans display the

most inegalitarian perceptions of the stratification

reality of their respective society, but at the same

time also have the lowest egalitarian aspirations. This is

in line with previous research that suggests that the

acceptance of inequality is higher in countries where

people also perceive actual inequality to be high

(Gijsberts, 2002; Osberg and Smeeding, 2006).

Conversely, Swedes’ perceptions of their stratification

reality are the most equal ones, yet not quite as equal

as they would like it. West Germans’ perceptions are in

between: while they resemble Swedes in their assess-

ment of the German stratification reality, they do

display smaller egalitarian aspirations. This ordering of

countries corresponds to expectations that can be

derived from welfare regime theory (Esping-Andersen,

1990).
While other researchers have found regime-specific

differences in attitudes (e.g. in demand for redistribu-

tion) on the aggregate level (Svallfors, 1997, 2003;

Andreß and Heien, 2001; Linos and West, 2003;

Jaeger, 2006), little agreement has been reached over
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the existence of regime-specific attitudinal cleavages.
Partly, this can be attributed to differences in the
operationalization of dependent and independent
variables, the selection of countries, and the specifica-
tion of regime influence (Jaeger, 2006, 2009; Linos and
West, 2003). However, most of these studies have used
general normative statements about the support for
government intervention and/or redistribution as de-
pendent variables. Instead, our approach has focused
on the public assessment of the particular shape of
stratification in a given country as well as citizens
respective preferences.

Looking at and comparing these two types of
perceptions, we find some evidence of country-specific
attitudinal cleavages in line with welfare regime theory.
We find socio-economic differences for perceived
stratification realities and stratification aspirations in
the United States, labour market-insider/outsider-
cleavages for perceived stratification realities as well
as (to some extent) aspirations in Germany, and a
gender/sector cleavage for stratification aspirations in
Sweden. However, our results are limited to the extent
that the satisfaction- and disappointment-hypotheses
for group differences receive only partial support: the
hypotheses receive the strongest support in Germany,
where we find effects in line with the expectations for
both perceived realities and aspirations, and they
receive less support in Sweden, where only the
satisfaction hypothesis for stratification aspirations
could be confirmed, and the United States, where
only the satisfaction hypothesis for stratification
realities could be confirmed. Overall, more evidence
supports the satisfaction- than the disappointment-
hypotheses. This indicates that aspirations towards
greater equality do not seem to be closely related to
the patterns of privilege and disadvantage set up (or
induced) by the welfare state. This might help to
explain why previous studies that focus solely on
general normative attitudes towards redistribution
rarely find regime-specific attitudinal cleavages.

Regarding the implications for welfare state theory,
our results can be interpreted in line with recent
theorizing that focuses on the role of ideas and culture
in explaining welfare state development (Steensland,
2006; van Oorschot, 2007). While it is not our aim
(and beyond the scope of our data) to provide direct
evidence for the impact of ideational factors on the
development of welfare states (e.g. their institutional
design or the level of social expenditures), our results
reveal a clear correspondence between the socio-
structural/institutional reality of a given welfare
regime and the attitudes of its citizens. Egalitarian

aspirations are greatest in Sweden, the social demo-
cratic welfare regime under study here, and smallest in
the liberal United States. While most previous research

focuses on the influence of institutions on attitudes,
recent evidence by Brooks and Manza (2006) suggests
that social policy preferences of the population also
influence welfare state spending. Thus, cultural factors
such as mass policy preferences appear to play a role in
welfare state development. Furthermore, ideas and
cultural values are institutionalized within certain
social policy programmes (Steensland 2006), and the
correspondence between institutionalized and popular

values is a crucial precondition for welfare state reform
(Pfau-Effinger, 2009; Sachweh, Burkhardt and Mau,
2009). One of the tasks for future research in this
direction would be to disentangle—both theoretically
and empirically—the interrelationships between ideas,
institutions, and public attitudes.

Notes

1. While we recognize that the welfare state is also a

complex normative arrangement and a focus on

self-interest alone is therefore inadequate to fully

understand welfare state attitudes (Rothstein,

1998; Bowles and Gintis, 2000; Mau, 2003), it

seems sufficient for the purpose of this article.

2. Moreover, institutions are also said to exert a

cognitive influence on actors’ preferences in that

they ‘provide information that helps individuals to

navigate the social world’s complexities’ (Pierson,

1994, p. 41). Welfare state institutions thus

influence individual attitudes also via the moral

values and ideas they embody (Rothstein, 1998;

Mau, 2003).

3. While widely referred to, Esping-Andersen’s

(1990) welfare regime typology was also subject

to various forms of criticism. For instance, various

proposals were made for adding a fourth regime

type (e.g. Leibfried, 1992; Castles and Mitchell,

1993; Korpi and Palme, 1998). Moreover, the

typology was also criticized on empirical grounds

(Obinger and Wagschal, 1998) and for its

gender-blindness (Orloff, 1993). For an overview

on the discussion, see Arts and Gelissen (2002).

4. We chose not to use a class-based measure (e.g.

EGP) since this would greatly increase the number

of comparisons in the multinomial logit models
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as class variables often differentiate between sev-

eral categories (Erikson and Goldthorpe, 1992).

Moreover, since we do not derive specific

hypotheses concerning particular classes

(e.g. working class or service class) a more

parsimonious measure of social position consist-

ing of income and education seems appropriate.

5. The question wording is: ‘It is the responsibility

of the government to reduce the differences in

income between people with high incomes and

those with low incomes—strongly agree, agree,

neither agree nor disagree, disagree, strongly

disagree’.

6. More recently, a growing number of studies on

welfare state attitudes also uses multilevel model-

ling (e.g. Jaeger, 2006; van Oorschot and Uunk,

2007). Since our main focus in the multivariate

analyses is on regime-specific attitudinal cleavages

and not on the influence of contextual factors on

attitudes, we do not see multilevel modeling as the

most appropriate statistical tool in our case.

Besides, the small number of countries in the

analysis would not fulfill the formal requirements

posed for multilevel modeling (Hadler, 2005).

7. This finding is not in line with other findings on

East–West differences in Germans’ social policy

attitudes (e.g. Roller, 1997; Noll and Roberts,

2003). See the Summary and concluding section

for a discussion.
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Figure A1 Question wording of the dependent variables
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Table A2 Change in predicted probabilities for perceived stratification realities and stratification aspirations,
United States

Independent variables Change Categories of dependent variable

(1) Small
elite

(2)
Pyramid

(3) Christmas
tree

(4) Middle
class

(5)
Rich

Panel 1: Realities
Age �� 0.02 0.00 0.00 �0.03 0.00
Female 0! 1 �0.05 0.04 0.02 �0.01 �0.00
College 0! 1 �0.09 �0.07 0.08 0.09 �0.01
Income (Ref.: income middle)

Relative affluence 0! 1 �0.03 �0.00 �0.00 0.03 �0.00
Relative poverty 0! 1 0.00 0.01 �0.00 �0.01 �0.00

Employment status (Ref.: not in labour force)
Employed full-time 0! 1 �0.05 0.08 �0.03 0.01 �0.01
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.05 0.01 �0.12 0.17 �0.01
Unemployed 0! 1 0.07 �0.07 �0.05 0.06 �0.02
Retired 0! 1 �0.03 0.12 �0.07 �0.02 �0.00

Public sector 0! 1 0.06 �0.01 0.04 �0.08 �0.00
Support for redistribution �� 0.06 0.03 �0.02 �0.07 0.00
Panel 2: Aspirations
Age �� 0.00 �0.01 0.02 0.00 �0.01
Female 0! 1 0.00 �0.04 �0.01 0.04 0.00
College 0! 1 �0.02 �0.04 �0.05 0.06 0.04
Income (Ref.: income middle)

Relative affluence 0! 1 0.00 0.03 0.03 �0.05 �0.01
Relative poverty 0! 1 �0.00 �0.00 0.06 �0.05 �0.02

Employment status (Ref.: not in labour force)
Employed full-time 0! 1 �0.00 �0.03 0.02 �0.01 0.02
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.00 �0.07 0.01 0.04 0.02
Unemployed 0! 1 0.00 �0.02 �0.10 0.09 0.03
Retired 0! 1 4.44e–06 0.04 0.09 �0.01 �0.12

Public sector 0! 1 5.13e–06 0.03 0.10 �0.03 �0.10
Support for redistribution �� 8.94e–06 0.00 �0.02 �0.01 0.03

Note: 0! 1 is the discrete change from 0 to 1. �� is the centred change of one standard deviation around the mean.

Table A1 Descriptive statistics

United States West Germany East Germany Sweden

Age (years) 43 (16) 47 (16) 49 (18) 45 (15)
Female (¼ 1) 0.54 (0.50) 0.49 (0.50) 0.50 (0.50) 0.50 (0.50)
College (¼ 1) 0.23 (0.42) 0.08 (0.28) 0.09 (0.29) 0.19 (0.44)
Income

Relative affluence 0.22 (0.41) 0.28 (0.45) 0.12 (0.32) 0.25 (0.43)
Income middle 0.59 (0.49) 0.55 (0.50) 0.63 (0.48) 0.57 (0.49)
Relative poverty 0.20 (0.40) 0.17 (0.37) 0.25 (0.43) 0.18 (0.38)

Employment status
Employed full-time 0.57 (0.49) 0.51 (0.50) 0.48 (0.50) 0.57 (0.50)
Employed part-time 0.13 (0.33) 0.06 (0.24) 0.05 (0.21) 0.15 (0.36)
Unemployed 0.03 (0.16) 0.04 (0.19) 0.11 (0.31) 0.03 (0.17)
Retired 0.10 (0.31) 0.21 (0.41) 0.31 (0.46) 0.13 (0.33)
Not in labour force 0.17 (0.38) 0.18 (0.39) 0.05 (0.22) 0.12 (0.32)

Public sector (¼ 1) 0.09 (0.29) 0.14 (0.35) 0.13 (0.34) 0.45 (0.50)
Support for redistribution 2.94 (1.22) 3.22 (1.17) 3.96 (0.94) 3.55 (1.17)
N 896 568 358 880

Note: Mean values, standard deviation in parentheses.
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Table A3 Change in predicted probabilities for perceived stratification realities and stratification aspirations,
Germany

Independent variables Change Categories of dependent variable

(1) Small
elite

(2)
Pyramid

(3) Christmas
tree

(4) Middle
class

(5)
Rich

Panel 1: Realities
Age �� 0.02 0.02 �0.00 �0.03 �0.00
Female 0! 1 0.02 0.04 �0.04 �0.02 0.00
College 0! 1 0.04 �0.07 0.01 0.03 �0.02
Income (Ref.: income middle)

Relative affluence 0! 1 �0.06 �0.01 �0.01 0.08 �0.00
Relative poverty 0! 1 0.06 �0.03 �0.04 �0.00 0.00

Employment status (Ref.: not in labour force)
Employed full-time 0! 1 0.01 0.13 �0.09 �0.05 0.01
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.07 0.20 �0.09 �0.05 0.01
Unemployed 0! 1 0.05 0.18 �0.11 �0.13 0.01
Retired 0! 1 �0.03 0.00 �0.01 0.04 0.01

Public sector 0! 1 �0.03 �0.07 0.07 0.03 �0.00
East Germany 0! 1 0.04 0.02 �0.03 �0.02 0.00
Support for redistribution �� 0.05 �0.01 �0.02 �0.02 0.00
Panel 2: Aspirations
Age �� 0.00 0.03 0.03 0.02 �0.07
Female 0! 1 �0.00 �0.03 0.06 0.00 �0.04
College 0! 1 �0.00 �0.01 0.01 0.02 �0.02
Income (Ref.: income middle)

Relative affluence 0! 1 0.00 �0.01 0.06 �0.14 0.09
Relative poverty 0! 1 �0.00 �0.00 �0.02 0.02 0.00

Employment status (Ref.: not in labour force)
Employed fulltime 0! 1 �0.00 �0.07 0.11 0.06 �0.10
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.01 �0.09 0.02 0.10 �0.03
Unemployed 0! 1 �0.00 �0.05 0.16 �0.02 �0.09
Retired 0! 1 �0.00 �0.05 0.08 �0.02 �0.00

Public sector 0! 1 0.00 0.03 0.02 �0.10 0.04
East Germany 0! 1 0.00 0.02 0.01 �0.17 0.13
Support for redistribution �� 0.00 �0.01 �0.01 �0.01 0.02

Note: 0! 1 is the discrete change from 0 to 1. �� is the centred change of one standard deviation around the mean.
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Table A4 Change in predicted probabilities in perceived stratification realities and stratification aspirations,
Sweden

Independent variables Change Categories of dependent variable

(1) Small
elite

(2)
Pyramid

(3) Christmas
tree

(4) Middle
class

(5)
Rich

Panel 1: Realities
Age �� 0.04 0.09 �0.06 �0.07 0.00
Female 0! 1 �0.01 0.02 �0.06 0.06 0.00
College 0! 1 �0.04 �0.13 0.10 0.07 �0.00
Income (Ref.: income middle)

Relative affluence 0! 1 �0.06 �0.03 0.02 0.08 �0.00
Relative poverty 0! 1 0.02 0.00 �0.00 �0.02 0.00

Employment status (Ref.: not in labour force)
Employed fulltime 0! 1 0.01 �0.03 �0.00 0.03 �0.00
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.02 �0.01 0.01 0.02 �0.01
Unemployed 0! 1 �0.04 0.11 0.01 �0.08 �0.00
Retired 0! 1 �0.06 �0.08 0.09 0.05 �0.00

Public sector 0! 1 0.03 0.02 �0.04 �0.00 0.00
Female� public sector 0! 1 �0.02 �0.03 0.01 �0.03 �0.00
Support for redistribution �� 0.05 0.05 0.01 �0.11 �0.00
Panel 2: Aspirations
Age �� �0.00 0.01 0.07 �0.04 �0.04
Female 0! 1 �0.73 0.02 0.02 0.33 0.35
College 0! 1 �0.00 0.03 �0.04 �0.02 �0.01
Income (Ref.: income middle)

Relative affluence 0! 1 0.00 �0.01 0.04 0.00 �0.04
Relative poverty 0! 1 0.00 0.01 0.02 0.03 �0.06

Employment status (Ref.: not in labour force)
Employed full-time 0! 1 �0.00 0.00 �0.03 �0.01 0.04
Employed part-time 0! 1 �0.00 0.02 �0.04 0.05 �0.03
Unemployed 0! 1 �0.00 0.00 �0.03 0.31 �0.28
Retired 0! 1 0.00 0.03 �0.06 0.13 �0.09

Public sector 0! 1 �0.00 0.01 �0.01 �0.03 0.03
Female� public sector 0! 1 1.00 �0.05 �0.07 �0.49 �0.39
Support for redistribution �� �0.00 �0.00 �0.02 0.02 0.01

Note: 0! 1 is the discrete change from 0 to 1. �� is the centred change of one standard deviation around the mean.
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